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SUVITO MEKRO

I was born in the year 1995 on 15th December in a small village 
called Kezoma (district of Kohima Nagaland) around 30-40 km 
from Kohima town. 

In my family, my mother and one elder sister. I am the only boy of 
my family. My sister at present is now doing her BA-2 at Kohima.  
and me doing my High School final exam. My mother work so hard 
to look after me and my sister, with aim that me and my sister can 
become someone in future. Even though she (mom) is a farmer. 

I as a small boy in me year 1999-2001 my mother sent me to 
Government School. I studied in my own native place for three 
year around. But in the year 2002 I was brought to Eden Garden 
Children's Home and Sacred Heart School. For me beginning of my 
first time to other place and hostel, I was so confused with 
everything, like place, people etc. with those again I was the 
smallest in the hostel. I was admitted in class 10 for my high school 
but unfortunately I fail in my first year. But I did not lost hope, 
again I continous in me same class, but again fail. I studied in class 
for three years. With all those failures I continous to stand up. 

It's due to the help of our heavenly God, my parent and teachers 
support. I started to come up of my failure. And now at present I 
stayed in Eden Gardens Hostel for 12 years. 

During school and hostel holidays I go and helped my mother since 
she is a farmer. I work in the fields, do harvesting and so on. At 
this present I am preparing for my high  school final exam, with 
the aim to become some great/one in future. 

My Nagaland 
Home for you and me 
Welcoming Everyone 
Anytime, any moment 








